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Economic Issues 

ISSUES SENATOR ARLEN SPECTER SENATOR BOB CASEY, JR. 

   

H. J. Res. 45 - As Amended; A 
joint resolution increasing the 
public debt by $1.9 trillion. 

Yea Yea 

Amendment  3308 to H.J. Res 45 
To reduce the deficit by creating 
5-year spending caps.    

Nay Nay 

Amendment 3301 to H.J. Res. 45 
To terminate authority under the 
Troubled Asset Relief Program 

Nay Nay 

H.R. 4314 to raise debt 
ceiling  by $290 billion 

Yea Yea 

Johanns Amendment to HUD 
Appropriations bill  prohibiting 
funds to ACORN 

Yea Nay 

Allocate an additional $2 billion 
for Cash for Clunkers 

Yea Yea 

Decreased funding for 
International Monetary Fund    

 
Nay 

 
Nay 

Prohibit use of TARP funds for 
purchase of common stock, and 
for other purposes 

 
Nay 

 
                     Nay 

Remove impediments to the 
repayment of funds received 
under TARP.   

 
Nay 

 
Nay 

Prevent taxpayer funded bailout 
to auto industry. 

 
Yea 

 
Nay 

End $272 billion in spending on 
bailouts under TARP and reduce 
record deficits and debt.          

 
Yea 

 
Nay 

To prohibit ACORN from 
receiving assistance under H.R. 
1388 

 
Yea 

 
Nay 

Passage of H.R. 1388 – GIVE 
Act -250,000 paid volunteers by 
2014 and much more!         

 
Yea 

 
Yea 

Prohibit funding for wasteful 
pork projects                    

 
Nay 

 
Nay 

Allow free exercise of religion at 
institutions of higher education 
that receive stimulus money.         

 
Yea 

 
Nay 

Stimulus Package (H.R. 1) Yea Yea 
   

   

   

   

   

   



   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

 


